

54-JM-20160114 2016-2018		Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt							
Division 1									
County	CHOWAN	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - TARBORO-Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	\$ 62.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70	\$ 41.70	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Murfreesboro-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
County	DARE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
County	GATES	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	NO BID	
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Murfreesboro-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		\$ 83.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
County	HERTFORD	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B I-2, I-1, TYPE H	B25.0B TYPE HB	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Contracting-Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	\$ 62.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70	\$ 41.70	NO BID	
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Murfreesboro-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
County	BERTIE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B I-2, I-1, TYPE H	B25.0B TYPE HB	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Rocky Mount-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID	
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	NO BID	
Carolina Asphalt-Elizabeth-8765		NO BID	\$ 82.50	\$ 74.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Windsor-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
County	CAMDEN	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B I-2, I-1, TYPE H	B25.0B TYPE HB	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. -Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
County	CURRITUCK	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50	NO BID	
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	
County	MARTIN	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Rocky Mount-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID	
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	\$ 62.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70	\$ 41.70	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95	\$ 45.95	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Windsor-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
County	NORTHAMPTON	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Barnhill Cont. - Rocky Mount-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID	

RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00		\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gaston -9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
County	PASQUOTANK	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Barnhill Cont. - Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00		\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00		\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50		\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00		NO BID
County	PERQUIMANS	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Barnhill Cont. - Elizabeth City-4209		NO BID	\$ 77.00		\$ 77.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00		NO BID
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00		\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Windsor-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00		\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50		\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00		NO BID
County	WASHINGTON	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Barnhill Cont. - Williamston-4209		NO BID	\$ 70.00		\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 61.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	\$ 42.50		\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - New Bern-5963		\$ 75.25	\$ 71.05		\$ 56.00	\$ 52.70	\$ 48.50		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Windsor-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING - Elizabeth City-17420		\$ 64.00	\$ 77.00		\$ 66.00	\$ 63.50	\$ 63.50		NO BID
RPC CONTRACTING-Kitty Hawk-17420		NO BID	\$ 83.50		\$ 70.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00		NO BID

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
Barnhill Contracting-Castle Hayne-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
Barnhill Contracting-Castle Hayne-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
ONSLow GRADING & PAVING-Hubert-4823	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 56.25	\$ 57.50	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	ONSLow SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Deppe-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
ONSLow GRADING & PAVING-Hubert-4823	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 56.25	\$ 57.50	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - New Bern-5963	\$ 75.25	\$ 71.05		\$ 56.00	\$ 52.70	\$ 48.50	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	DUPLIN SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
BARNHILL Cont-Roseboro-4209	NO BID	\$ 66.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	NO BID
BARNHILL Cont-Deppe-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
ONSLow GRADING & PAVING-Hubert-4823	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 56.25	\$ 57.50	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Princeton-5963	\$ 66.80	\$ 66.80		\$ 57.00	\$ 51.70	\$ 46.35	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	SAMPSON SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
BARNHILL Cont-Roseboro-4209	NO BID	\$ 66.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	NO BID
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Princeton-4209	NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816	NO BID	\$ 76.00		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816	NO BID	NO BID		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Princeton-5963	\$ 66.80	\$ 66.80		\$ 57.00	\$ 51.70	\$ 46.35	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	PENDER SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
Barnhill Contracting-Castle Hayne-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
BARNHILL Cont-Deppe-4209	NO BID	\$ 67.00		\$ 67.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID
ONSLow GRADING & PAVING-Hubert-4823	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 56.25	\$ 57.50	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963	\$ 73.30	\$ 70.05		\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
DIVISION 4							
County	EDGECOMBE SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Greenville-4209	NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Rocky Mount-4209	NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034	\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00		\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gold Rock-9399	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963	\$ 62.50	\$ 62.50		\$ 59.00	\$ 45.95	\$ 41.70	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963	\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95	NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00
County	HALIFAX SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Rocky Mount-4209	NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID

RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00		\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - GASTON-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Franklin-5963		\$ 65.65	\$ 65.65		\$ 52.50	\$ 47.25	\$ 42.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Henderson-5963		\$ 73.35	\$ 73.35		\$ 55.00	\$ 50.45	\$ 45.85		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
County	JOHNSTON	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Princeton-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Rocky Mount-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
CAROLINA SUNROCK - RDU-23083		NO BID	NO BID		\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00		130.00
Coastal Carolina - APAC - Kinston-PRINCETON		NO BID							
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
GELDER AND ASSOCIATES - RALEIGH-7442		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 53.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 53.00		NO BID
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00		NO BID
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	NO BID		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Princeton-5963		\$ 66.80	\$ 66.80		\$ 57.00	\$ 51.70	\$ 46.35		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
County	NASH	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
BARNHILL - ROCKY MT -4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gold Rock-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00		\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Franklin-5963		\$ 65.65	\$ 65.65		\$ 52.50	\$ 47.25	\$ 42.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
County	WAYNE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Princeton-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gold Rock-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
RIGHTMYER MACHINE RENTAL -Northampton-24034		\$ 79.00	\$ 79.00		\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Franklin-5963		\$ 65.65	\$ 65.65		\$ 52.50	\$ 47.25	\$ 42.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
County	WILSON	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Princeton-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
BARNHILL CONTRACTING-Rocky Mount-4209		NO BID	\$ 65.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 54.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Princeton-5963		\$ 66.80	\$ 66.80		\$ 57.00	\$ 51.70	\$ 46.35		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
Division 5		#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
County	DURHAM	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
BARNHILL CONT. - RALEIGH-4209		NO BID	NO BID		\$ 56.00/52.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 44.00		NO BID
CAROLINA SUNROCK - MDC-23083		NO BID	NO BID		\$ 50.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00		130.00
CAROLINA SUNROCK - Butner-23083		NO BID	NO BID		\$ 50.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Holly Springs-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC,Fred Smith - Knightdale-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00		NO BID
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gold Rock-9399		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Greenville-5963		\$ 62.50	\$ 62.50		\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Princeton-5963		\$ 66.80	\$ 66.80		\$ 57.00	\$ 51.70	\$ 46.35		NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Sims-5963		\$ 70.70	\$ 70.70		\$ 53.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 45.95		NO BID
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
County	FRANKLIN	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)		#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)

FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Wake Forest-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID	
FSCI LLC, Fred Smith - Westgate-47248		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID	
ROSE BROTHERS PAVING - Gold Rock-9399	\$	85.00	\$ 85.00	\$	85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Franklin-5963	\$	65.65	\$ 65.65	\$	52.50	\$ 47.25	\$ 42.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Henderson-5963	\$	73.35	\$ 73.35	\$	55.00	\$ 59.45	\$ 45.85	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
DIVISION 6		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	BLADEN	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Lumberton-4209		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	\$	130.00
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Fayetteville		NO BID	NO BID	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963		NO BID	\$ 73.30	\$ 79.05	\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Elkerbe-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	COLUMBUS	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Lumberton-4209		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	\$	130.00
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Wilmington-5963		NO BID	\$ 73.30	\$ 79.05	\$ 57.00	\$ 55.40	\$ 52.95	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Elkerbe-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	CUMBERLAND	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Fayetteville-4209		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$	71.10	\$ 71.10	\$	52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Elkerbe-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	HARNETT	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Fayetteville-4209		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	NO BID	
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Lumberton-4209		NO BID	NO BID	\$	NO BID	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	\$	130.00
GELDER AND ASSOCIATES - RALEIGH-7442		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 53.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 53.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$	71.10	\$ 71.10	\$	52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) Lillington-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	135.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Elkerbe-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	ROBESON	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Lumberton-4209		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 63.00	\$	130.00
HUDSON PAVING - Hamlet-19307		NO BID	\$ 71.00	\$	68.50	\$ 66.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$	68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Pittsboro-5963	\$	70.85	\$ 70.85	\$	67.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 59.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$	71.10	\$ 71.10	\$	52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
SHARPE BROTHERS - Liberty Rd.-74947		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID	
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Burlington-47989		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	58.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	NO BID	
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Pomona-47989		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$	180.00
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Jameson-47989		NO BID	NO BID	\$	60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	CASWELL	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BLYTHE CONSTRUCTION - Greensboro-32365		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 43.00	NO BID	
CAROLINA SUNROCK - MDC-23083		NO BID	NO BID	\$	60.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 57.00	\$	130.00
RILEY PAVING - New River-5722		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.50	\$	67.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 59.00	NO BID
S. T. WOOTEN - Pittsboro-5963	\$	70.85	\$ 70.85	\$	50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$	71.10	\$ 71.10	\$	52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Liberty Rd.-74947		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID	
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Burlington-47989		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	58.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	NO BID	
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Pomona-47989		NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$	60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$	180.00
THOMPSON-ARTHUR - Jameson-47989		NO BID	NO BID	\$	60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	130.00
		#1 Mat#101002105	#1 Mat#101002105	#2Mat#101002107	#2Mat#101002107	#3Mat#101002110	#4Mat#101002113	#5Mat#101001705	
County	CASWELL	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		

JOHNSON BROTHERS - St. Pauls-14816			NO BID		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
RILEY PAVING - Carthage-5722		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 60.52	\$ 63.82	\$ 53.50	\$ 53.50	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$ 71.10	\$ 71.10			\$ 52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
County	LEE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816			\$ 76.00		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	
RILEY PAVING - Carthage-5722		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Pea Ridge-5963	\$ 73.70	\$ 73.70			\$ 52.00	\$ 47.70	\$ 43.35	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Pittsboro-5963	\$ 70.85	\$ 70.85			\$ 50.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 41.70	NO BID	
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$ 71.10	\$ 71.10			\$ 52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
County	MONTGOMERY	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
C K Earnhardt & Sons-Albemarle-6795	NO BID	\$ 51.78	\$ 50.92	\$ 54.56	\$ 47.50	\$ 49.22	NO BID		
HUDSON PAVING - HAMLET-19307	NO BID	\$ 71.00		\$ 68.50	\$ 66.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID		
QPR-Brooks Mill Rd.-3551	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
RILEY PAVING - Black Ankle-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 72.50	\$ 74.00	\$ 56.50	\$ 55.00	NO BID		
RILEY PAVING - Carthage-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 64.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID		
Thompson Arthur - Jamestown-47989	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID		
Thompson Arthur - Pomona-47989	NO BID	\$ 66.00		\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 180.00	
Thompson Arthur-Randleman	NO BID	NO BID		\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
County	MOORE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
C. K. Earnhardt - Albemarle-6795	NO BID	\$ 51.78	\$ 50.92	\$ 54.56	\$ 47.50	\$ 49.22	NO BID		
HUDSON PAVING - HAMLET-19307	NO BID	\$ 71.00		\$ 68.50	\$ 66.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID		
JOHNSON BROTHERS - Lillington-14816	NO BID	\$ 76.00		\$ 68.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID		
QPR-Brooks Mill Rd.-3551	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
RILEY PAVING - Black Ankle-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 72.50	\$ 74.00	\$ 56.50	\$ 55.00	NO BID		
RILEY PAVING - Carthage-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID		
S. T. WOOTEN - Pea Ridge-5963	\$ 73.70	\$ 73.70		\$ 52.00	\$ 47.70	\$ 43.35	NO BID		
S. T. WOOTEN - Sanford-5963	\$ 71.10	\$ 71.10		\$ 52.00	\$ 49.40	\$ 46.80	NO BID		
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
County	RANDOLPH	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BL YTHE CONSTRUCTION - Greensboro-32365	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 43.00	NO BID		
C. K. Earnhardt - Albemarle-6795	NO BID	\$ 51.78	\$ 50.92	\$ 54.56	\$ 47.50	\$ 49.22	NO BID		
HANES CONST. - THOMASVILLE-20184	NO BID	\$ 63.50	\$ 53.50	\$ 55.50	\$ 47.50	\$ 47.50	NO BID		
QPR-Brooks Mill Rd.-3551	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
RILEY PAVING - Black Ankle-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 73.00	\$ 73.00	\$ 56.14	\$ 54.00	NO BID		
RILEY PAVING - Liberty-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 58.00	NO BID		
SHARPE BROTHERS - Lebanon Rd.-74947	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID		
SHARPE BROTHERS - Liberty Rd.-74947	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00	NO BID		
THOMPSON ARTHUR - Jamestown-47989	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 180.00	
THOMPSON ARTHUR - Pomona-47989	NO BID	\$ 66.00		\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	NO BID	
THOMPSON ARTHUR - Randleman-47989	NO BID	NO BID		\$ 60.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
County	RICHMOND	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Lumberton-4209	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
BARNHILL CONTRACTING - Rockingham-4209	NO BID	\$ 66.00		\$ 65.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID		
C. K. Earnhardt - Albemarle-6795	NO BID	\$ 51.78	\$ 50.92	\$ 54.56	\$ 47.50	\$ 49.22	NO BID		
HUDSON PAVING - HAMLET-19307	NO BID	\$ 71.00		\$ 68.50	\$ 66.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID		
QPR-Brooks Mill Rd.-3551	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
RILEY PAVING - Black Ankle-5722	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 59.00	\$ 58.00	NO BID		
UNIQUE PAVING - (R&D PACKING) Ellerbe-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (HAMMAKER) Greensboro-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS) Lillington-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (JOHNSON BROS.) St. Pauls-16955	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 135.00	

UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
County	CATAWBA	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
BL YTHE CONSTRUCTION - Denver-32365		NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 44.50	\$ 47.50	\$ 43.00	\$ 41.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 63.45	NO BID	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Hickory-17884		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Statesville-17884		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	
QPR - Charlotte-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	CLEVELAND	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
D & S Asphalt Materials-Millspring-32250		NO BID	\$ 70.25	\$ 64.25	\$ 68.25	\$ 62.25	\$ 62.25	NO BID	
QPR - Charlotte-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	GASTON	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
BL YTHE BROTHERS - CHARLOTTE-33472		NO BID	\$ 55.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	
BL YTHE CONSTRUCTION - Denver-32365		NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 44.50	\$ 47.50	\$ 43.00	\$ 41.00	NO BID	
QPR - Charlotte-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	IREDELL	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
BL YTHE BROTHERS - Concord-33472		NO BID	\$ 55.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 44.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 38.00	NO BID	
BL YTHE CONSTRUCTION - Reames-32365		NO BID	\$ 59.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 47.50	\$ 40.00	\$ 45.00	NO BID	
FEREBEE CORP. - Concord-9550		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 37.00	NO BID	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Hickory-17884		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Statesville-17884		NO BID	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	
QPR - Charlotte-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	LINCOLN	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
BL YTHE CONSTRUCTION - Denver-32365		NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 44.50	\$ 47.50	\$ 43.00	\$ 41.00	NO BID	
QPR - Charlotte-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 97.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (THOMPSON) Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	BUNCOMBE	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
D & S ASPHALT MATERIALS-Millspring-32250		NO BID	\$ 70.25	\$ 64.25	\$ 68.25	\$ 62.25	\$ 62.25	NO BID	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Black Mountain-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.50	\$ 80.50	\$ 69.50	\$ 69.50	NO BID	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Enka-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.50	\$ 80.50	\$ 71.00	\$ 71.00	NO BID	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hendersonville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.50	\$ 80.50	\$ 67.50	\$ 67.50	NO BID	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Waynesville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Weaverville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.50	\$ 80.50	\$ 71.00	\$ 71.00	NO BID	
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 63.45	NO BID	NO BID	
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topon-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	
		#1 Mat.#101002105	#1 Mat.#101002105	#2Mat.#101002107	#2Mat.#101002107	#3Mat.#101002110	#4Mat.#101002113	#5Mat.#101001705	
		SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	COLD MIX	
County	BURKE	SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)	
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number									
D & S Asphalt Materials-Millspring-32250s		NO BID	\$ 70.25	\$ 64.25	\$ 68.25	\$ 62.25	\$ 62.25	NO BID	
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 63.45	NO BID	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Hickory-17884		NO BID	\$ 69.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Morganton-17884		NO BID	\$ 71.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 71.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	NO BID	
QPR - N. Wilkesboro-3551		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 106.00	
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 110.00	

UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00
County	MADISON	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX			
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Waynesville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Weaverville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 81.00	\$ 86.00	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 65.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 64.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	MCDOWELL	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
D & S ASPHALT MATERIALS-Millspring-32250		NO BID	\$ 70.25	\$ 64.25	\$ 68.25	\$ 62.25	\$ 62.25	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hendersonville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 64.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Marion-17884		NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Morgantown-17884		NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	MITCHELL	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 64.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hendersonville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Marion-17884		NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 67.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
MAYMEAD MATERIALS - Pineola-17884		NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 76.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 68.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	RUTHERFORD	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
D & S Asphalt Materials-Millspring-32250		NO BID	\$ 70.25	\$ 64.25	\$ 68.25	\$ 62.25	\$ 62.25	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hendersonville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Rutherfordton-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 67.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 64.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	YANCEY	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
JOHNSON PAVING - Marion-13869		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.34	\$ 69.95	\$ 64.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hendersonville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (RADFORD QUAR) Wilkesboro-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
DIVISION 14										
County	CHEROKEE	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION - Cherokee-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hayesville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
FORTNER CONTRACTING - Bryson City-61355		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 94.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 88.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	CLAY	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hayesville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	GRAHAM	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		
Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number		SA-1	S4.75A	S9.5B	SF9.5A, S9.5B	I-19.0B	B25.0B	WITH SPX (QTY/TONS 300)		
FORTNER CONTRACTING - Bryson City-61355		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 94.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 88.00	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Dillsboro-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 88.50	\$ 74.50	\$ 74.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
HARRISON CONSTRUCTION CO - Hayesville-59015		NO BID	NO BID	\$ 83.50	\$ 88.50	\$ 71.50	\$ 71.50	NO BID	NO BID	110.00
UNIQUE PAVING (THOMPSON) - Rutherfordton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
UNIQUE PAVING - (NANTAHALA) Topton-16955		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$	110.00	
County	HAYWOOD	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#1 Mat.#101002105 SAND (QTY/TONS 600)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#2Mat.#101002107 SURF (QTY/TONS 500)	#3Mat.#101002110 BIND. (QTY/TONS 500)	#4Mat.#101002113 BASE (QTY/TONS 500)	#5Mat.#101001705 COLD MIX		

