
Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

54-DH-20180115 #1 Mat.#1001002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-18725

Adams Construction Company-Mt. Airy NO BID NO BID 75.35$                                 71.30$                                             67.50$                                   65.50$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-47989

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Kernersville - Plant # 4 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Winston-Salem - Plant # 5 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      180.00$                               

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Burlington - Plant # 8 NO BID 72.00$                               65.00$                                 63.00$                                             57.00$                                   57.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Randleman - Plant # 9 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Jamestown - Plant # 10 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Greensboro - Plant # 11 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      180.00$                               

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Mocksville - Plant # 13 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Stokesdale - Plant # 15 NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic, Inc. T-Arthur Div.-Winston-Salem-Glenn Ave NO BID 74.00$                               70.00$                                 68.00$                                             60.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.# 101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-59015

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Candler 91.50$                               91.50$                               86.50$                                 82.50$                                             72.50$                                   72.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Weaverville 91.50$                               91.50$                               86.50$                                 82.50$                                             73.50$                                   73.50$                                      117.00$                               

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Black Mountain NO BID 91.50$                               86.50$                                 82.50$                                             83.50$                                   73.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Rutherfordton NO BID NO BID 78.00$                                 74.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Hendersonville NO BID NO BID 85.50$                                 81.50$                                             73.50$                                   73.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Murphy NO BID NO BID 94.50$                                 82.00$                                             79.00$                                   79.00$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Haynesville NO BID NO BID 94.50$                                 83.50$                                             79.00$                                   79.00$                                      117.00$                               

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Waynesville NO BID 96.50$                               94.50$                                 90.50$                                             79.50$                                   79.50$                                      117.00$                               

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Dillsboro NO BID 96.50$                               94.50$                                 90.50$                                             80.50$                                   80.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Franklin NO BID NO BID 94.50$                                 90.50$                                             80.50$                                   8.50$                                        NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Bakersville NO BID NO BID 89.50$                                 86.50$                                             78.50$                                   78.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Saphire NO BID NO BID 87.50$                                 84.50$                                             74.50$                                   74.50$                                      NO BID

APAC-Atlantic Inc-Harrison Construction-Toxaway NO BID NO BID 87.50$                                 84.50$                                             74.50$                                   74.50$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-4190

Asphalt Paving of Shelby, Inc.-Kings Mountain NO BID 67.00$                               67.00$                                 67.00$                                             67.00$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-4209

Barnhill Contracting Company-Fayetteville 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   65.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Roseboro 70.00$                               70.00$                               69.00$                                 69.00$                                             67.00$                                   65.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Lumberton 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   65.00$                                      138.00$                               

Barnhill Contracting Company-Rockingham 70.00$                               70.00$                               69.00$                                 69.00$                                             65.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Elizabeth City 88.00$                               88.00$                               86.00$                                 86.00$                                             77.00$                                   77.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Williamston 82.00$                               82.00$                               80.00$                                 80.00$                                             70.00$                                   70.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Kinston 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Raleigh NO BID 70.00$                               60.00$                                 56.00$                                             52.00$                                   50.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Greenville 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Rocky Mount 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Keansville 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             65.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Castle Hayne 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Jacksonville 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-Princeton 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

Barnhill Contracting Company-New Bern 70.00$                               70.00$                               70.00$                                 70.00$                                             67.00$                                   64.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-33472

Blythe Brothers Asphalt Co., LLC-Concord NO BID NO BID 57.00$                                 57.00$                                             54.00$                                   54.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Brothers Asphalt Co., LLC-Charlotte(Pineville) NO BID NO BID 57.00$                                 57.00$                                             54.00$                                   54.00$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-77730

Blythe Construction, Inc.-Greensboro NO BID NO BID 63.00$                                 60.00$                                             52.00$                                   50.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Construction, Inc.-Concord NO BID 83.00$                               60.00$                                 59.00$                                             55.00$                                   55.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Construction, Inc.-Pineville NO BID 73.00$                               58.00$                                 57.00$                                             56.00$                                   55.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Construction, Inc.-North Plant NO BID 66.00$                               63.00$                                 62.00$                                             55.00$                                   55.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Construction, Inc.-East Plant NO BID 75.00$                               59.00$                                 57.00$                                             54.00$                                   54.00$                                      NO BID

Blythe Construction, Inc.-Lake Norman NO BID 73.00$                               59.00$                                 58.00$                                             54.00$                                   54.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-26639

Bogg's Materials , Inc.-Monroe(Plant 1) NO BID 71.85$                               74.50$                                 71.97$                                             61.85$                                   59.85$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-6795

C.K. Earnhardt & Sons, Inc.-Albermarle NO BID 58.08$                               61.34$                                 56.19$                                             51.61$                                   53.60$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#1010022765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-5725

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N.Wilkesboro-115 Plt. (Alleghany County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-Elkin (Alleghany County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-Twin City(Alleghany County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N.Wilkesboro-115 Plt. (Surry County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-Elkin (Surry County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-Twin City (Surry County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-115 Plt. (Wilkes County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-Elkin (Wilkes County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-Twin City (Wilkes County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-115 Plt. (Yadkin County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-Elkin (Yadkin County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Carl Rose & Sons, Inc.-N. Wilkesboro-Twin City  (Yadkin County) NO BID 68.00$                               68.00$                                 68.00$                                             68.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-23083

Corlina Sunrock, LLC-Butner 80.00$                               80.00$                               58.00$                                 56.00$                                             51.00$                                   51.00$                                      NO BID

Carolina Sunrock, LLC-Durham 80.00$                               80.00$                               59.00$                                 56.00$                                             51.00$                                   51.00$                                      140.00$                               

Carolina Sunrock, LLC-Raleigh 80.00$                               80.00$                               59.00$                                 56.00$                                             51.00$                                   51.00$                                      NO BID

Carolina Sunrock, LLC-Wake Forest 80.00$                               80.00$                               59.00$                                 56.00$                                             51.00$                                   51.00$                                      NO BID

Carolina Sunrock, LLC-Roxboro 80.00$                               80.00$                               67.00$                                 64.00$                                             56.00$                                   56.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-32250

D & S Asphalt Materials, Inc.-Mill Spring NO BID 78.00$                               73.00$                                 69.00$                                             68.00$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-9550

Ferebee Corporation-Charlotte 48.50$                               50.00$                               45.00$                                 45.00$                                             42.50$                                   41.00$                                      NO BID

Ferebee Corporation-Concord 48.50$                               50.00$                               45.00$                                 45.00$                                             42.50$                                   41.00$                                      NO BID

Ferebee Corporation-Charlotte(Pineville Plant) 48.50$                               50.00$                               45.00$                                 45.00$                                             42.50$                                   41.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-50600

Garris Grading & Paving, Inc.-Farmville 85.00$                               NO BID 85.00$                                 85.00$                                             85.00$                                   85.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-7442

Gelder and Associates, Inc.-Raleigh NO BID NO BID 60.00$                                 60.00$                                             59.00$                                   59.00$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-20184

Hanes Construction Company-Thomasville NO BID 70.50$                               62.50$                                 60.50$                                             54.50$                                   54.50$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-43082

Highland Paving Co., LLC-Fayetteville 83.00$                               83.00$                               78.00$                                 78.00$                                             71.00$                                   69.00$                                      NO BID

Highland Paving Co., LLC-Leland NO BID 83.00$                               83.00$                                 83.00$                                             73.00$                                   71.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-19307

Hudson Paving, Inc.-Hamlet NO BID 85.00$                               80.00$                                 80.00$                                             76.00$                                   75.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-23920

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.-Mint Hill NO BID 75.75$                               66.00$                                 66.10$                                             60.75$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.-Lexington NO BID 75.75$                               68.25$                                 68.25$                                             65.00$                                   65.50$                                      NO BID

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.-New London NO BID 75.75$                               67.50$                                 66.00$                                             62.50$                                   62.50$                                      NO BID

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.-Salisbury NO BID 75.75$                               68.25$                                 68.25$                                             68.25$                                   68.25$                                      NO BID

J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.-Conover NO BID 76.00$                               72.80$                                 67.50$                                             61.60$                                   56.50$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-14816

Johnson Brothers Utility & Paving-Lillington 75.00$                               75.00$                               75.00$                                 75.00$                                             75.00$                                   75.00$                                      NO BID

Johnson Brothers Utility & Paving-St. Pauls 75.00$                               75.00$                               75.00$                                 75.00$                                             75.00$                                   75.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-13869

Johnson Paving Company, Inc.-Marion NO BID NO BID 77.18$                                 70.58$                                             65.87$                                   65.87$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-10121

Lane Construction Corporation-Kannapolis NO BID NO BID 62.00$                                 59.00$                                             54.50$                                   53.00$                                      NO BID

Lane Construction Corporation-Kings Mountain NO BID NO BID 54.00$                                 53.00$                                             50.00$                                   50.00$                                      NO BID

Lane Construction Corporation-Pineville NO BID NO BID 53.00$                                 52.50$                                             50.00$                                   50.00$                                      NO BID

Lane Construction Corporation-Charlotte NO BID NO BID 53.00$                                 52.50$                                             50.00$                                   50.00$                                      NO BID

Lane Construction Corporation-Garner NO BID 62.00$                               52.00$                                 52.00$                                             48.00$                                   48.00$                                      NO BID

Lane Construction Corporation-Raleigh NO BID 62.00$                               53.00$                                 53.00$                                             48.00$                                   48.00$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-17884

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Prison Camp Rd, Mountain City NO BID 80.00$                               80.00$                                 75.00$                                             70.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Boone NO BID 80.00$                               80.00$                                 75.00$                                             70.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Denver NO BID 74.00$                               74.00$                                 69.00$                                             64.00$                                   62.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Hickory NO BID 74.00$                               74.00$                                 69.00$                                             64.00$                                   62.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Crumpler NO BID 80.00$                               80.00$                                 75.00$                                             70.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Marion NO BID 79.00$                               79.00$                                 74.00$                                             69.00$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Lenoir NO BID 79.00$                               79.00$                                 74.00$                                             69.00$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Morganton NO BID 79.00$                               79.00$                                 74.00$                                             69.00$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Pineola NO BID 80.00$                               80.00$                                 75.00$                                             70.00$                                   68.00$                                      NO BID

Maymead Materials, Inc.-Statesville NO BID 75.00$                               75.00$                                 70.00$                                             65.00$                                   63.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-4823

Onslow Grading & Paving, Inc.-Hubret Plant NO BID 89.50$                               74.00$                                 74.00$                                             68.40$                                   70.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002768 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-77840

Piedmont Asphalt, LLC-Pelham NO BID NO BID 64.65$                                 62.75$                                             56.50$                                   56.00 NO BID

Piedmont Asphalt, LLC-Reidsville NO BID NO BID 66.80$                                 64.85$                                             59.50$                                   56.50$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-3551

Quikrete Companies, Inc. dba QPR-Mint Hill NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.70$                                 

Quikrete Companies, Inc. dba QPR-N. Wilkesboro NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.70$                                 
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-17420

R.P.C. Contracting, Inc.-Kitty Hawk NO BID 93.00$                               81.00$                                 82.00$                                             78.00$                                   78.00$                                      NO BID

R.P.C. Contracting, Inc.-Elizabeth City 74.00$                               81.00$                               75.00$                                 76.00$                                             73.00$                                   74.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-24034

Rightmyer Machine Rentals, Inc.-Garysburg 96.00$                               96.00$                               85.00$                                 NO BID 85.00$                                   85.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-5722

Riley Paving, Inc.-Carthage NO BID NO BID 69.50$                                 69.50$                                             57.00$                                   59.00$                                      NO BID

Riley Paving, Inc.-Staley NO BID NO BID 69.00$                                 68.00$                                             61.00$                                   62.00$                                      NO BID

Riley Paving, Inc.-Star NO BID NO BID 70.25$                                 71.00$                                             68.70$                                   67.00$                                      NO BID

Riley Paving, Inc.-Burlington NO BID NO BID 64.00$                                 64.00$                                             59.00$                                   60.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-86578

Rogers Group, LLC-Hendersonville NO BID NO BID 66.00$                                 62.00$                                             60.00$                                   61.00$                                      NO BID
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Bituminous Plant Mixed Asphalt Tabulation

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-9399

Rose Brothers Paving Co., Inc.-Murfreesboro 94.00$                               94.00$                               94.00$                                 94.00$                                             94.00$                                   94.00$                                      NO BID

Rose Brothers Paving Co., Inc.-Gaston 94.00$                               94.00$                               94.00$                                 94.00$                                             94.00$                                   94.00$                                      NO BID

Rose Brothers Paving Co., Inc.-Windsor 94.00$                               94.00$                               94.00$                                 94.00$                                             94.00$                                   94.00$                                      NO BID

Rose Brothers Paving Co., Inc.-Greenville 94.00$                               94.00$                               94.00$                                 94.00$                                             94.00$                                   94.00$                                      NO BID

Rose Brothers Paving Co., Inc.-Gold Rock 94.00$                               94.00$                               94.00$                                 94.00$                                             94.00$                                   94.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-5963

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Wilmington 67.70$                               65.45$                               57.75$                                 56.15$                                             54.90$                                   53.30$                                      150.00$                               

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Henderson 66.95$                               62.10$                               53.65$                                 52.05$                                             46.85$                                   45.60$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Sims 62.55$                               58.55$                               53.00$                                 51.40$                                             48.70$                                   46.95$                                      129.00$                               

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Princeton 60.95$                               59.15$                               54.55$                                 51.90$                                             48.35$                                   47.90$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Franklinton 62.05$                               60.70$                               55.55$                                 51.80$                                             46.75$                                   45.50$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Pittsboro 59.25$                               55.35$                               52.00$                                 49.45$                                             45.80$                                   44.50$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-New Hill 59.70$                               55.40$                               50.00$                                 48.30$                                             44.30$                                   43.40$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Sanford 63.55$                               60.45$                               54.65$                                 52.10$                                             48.80$                                   48.00$                                      129.00$                               

S.T. Wooten Corporation-Greenville 61.90$                               55.50$                               50.00$                                 49.10$                                             44.70$                                   44.25$                                      NO BID

S.T. Wooten Corporation-New Bern 64.90$                               59.20$                               58.20$                                 58.75$                                             55.70$                                   55.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Vendor Number-74947

Sharpe Brothers-Lebanon-Plant 2 NO BID NO BID 60.00$                                 60.00$                                             57.00$                                   57.00$                                      NO BID

Sharpe Brothers-Greensboro-Plant 3 NO BID NO BID 60.00$                                 60.00$                                             57.00$                                   57.00$                                      NO BID

Sharpe Brothers-Kernersville-Plant 4 NO BID NO BID 60.00$                                 60.00$                                             57.00$                                   57.00$                                      NO BID

#1 Mat.#101002767 #1 Mat.#101002768 #2Mat.#101002769 #3Mat.#101002771 #4Mat.#101002765 #5Mat.#101002766 #5Mat.#101001700

SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE SURFACE BINDER BASE COLD PATCH

(QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500) (QTY/TONS 500)

SA-1 S4.75A S9.5B S9.5C I-19.0C B25.0C ASPHALT COLD MIX

Bidder, Plant Location and Vendor Number

Vendor Number-16955

Unique Paving Materials Corp.-R&D Packaging-Ellerbe NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 135.00$                               

Unique Paving Materials Corp.-Johnson Brothers.-Lillington NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 140.00$                               

Unique Paving Materials Corp.-Johnson Brothers-St. Pauls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 140.00$                               

Unique Paving Materials Corp.-Rutherfordton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 115.00$                               

Unique Paving Materials Corp.-Topton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 115.00$                               
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