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North Carolina  
Department of Administration 

Division of Purchase & Contract 

Machelle Sanders 
Secretary 

Odessa McGlown 
State Purchasing Officer 

Contract Award Certification 
Date: March 23, 2020 

Bid/File Number: 201901224 Commodity: 550-89 
Traffic Signal Parts 

To: 
Paul Thompson  
MoboTrex, Inc. 
1550 Standing Ridge Drive  
Powhatan, VA 23139 
pthompson@mobotrex.com 
804-794-1633

From: 
Nicole Mathis for Rich Reber 
919-807-4539
richard.reber@doa.nc.gov
Division of Purchase and Contract

Agency Requisition Number:  54-KM-20190819 
I am pleased to inform you that, following the evaluation process, the Division of Purchase and Contract proposes to 
accept your offer in relation to the above commodity.  You will be contacted with further details and instructions by the 
using agency. 

Item(s)  
Line Item 38: $7,500.00 
Line Item 43: $77,500.00 
Line Item 45: $300.00 
Lot #12 (Line Items 74 – 75) $95,750.00 

Award Amount: 
$181,050.00 

Using Agency: 
DEPARTMENT – Transportation 
Kris May 
919-707-2624
ktmay@ncdot.gov
Raleigh, NC 27611

Contract Term: Three (3) year term, upon contract award. 

Comments: This is an Agency Specific Term Contract. Quantities are estimated but no minimum or maximum 
quantities are guaranteed. Continuation of the contract is subject to availability of funds.  

Please Note: 
1. This is not a purchase order. Do not make shipment until you have received an official order from the using

agency. 
2. Invoices should be made out to the using agency and forwarded directly to them for payment.
3. The exact items certified and ordered must be shipped.  No substitutions shall be made without prior approval of

the Division of Purchase and Contract.
4. Applicable North Carolina Sales and use tax shall be added to invoices as a separate item.
5. Please note the contract award description above, the contract awarded to you may be a portion of the contract,

rather than the complete contract.

Richard J. Reber 

Signature 

mailto:pthompson@mobotrex.com
mailto:richard.reber@doa.nc.gov
mailto:ktmay@ncdot.gov
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LOT #1 

Items 1 – 8 as one composite lot Vendor MoboTrex, Inc

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1 200 EA. SIG HEAD, 3 SEC, 8” LED COMPATIBLE – ALUM MoboTrex, Inc. SG130A2C11YYY30-00 170.00$                                34,000.00$                         

2 5 EA. SIG HD 3-SEC, 8" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG130A2C11BBB30-00 190.00$                                950.00$                              

3 5 EA SIG HEAD, 3-SEC, 8" POLY LED (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG130A1C11YYY30-00 102.00$                                510.00$                              

4 5 EA SIG HD 3-SEC, 8" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG103A1C11BBB30-00 115.00$                                575.00$                              

5 10 EA TUNNEL VISOR-8 IN. (YELLOW COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. A85229112 18.00$                                  180.00$                              

6 1 EA TUNNEL VISOR-8IN. POLY (YELLOW COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. A70011904 12.00$                                  12.00$                                

7 1 EA BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECTION 8" SIGNALS MoboTrex, Inc. BPA530ANF 58.00$                                  58.00$                                

8 1 EA BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECT 8" SIGNALS (POLY) Pelco, Inc. BK-1006-F 66.00$                                  66.00$                                

36,351.00$                            LOT 1 - SUBTOTAL

LOT #2

Items 9 – 32 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

9 3000 EA. SIG HEAD,3-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM. MoboTrex, Inc. SG103A2C11YYY30-00 165.00$                                495,000.00$                       

10 100 EA. SIG HD 3-SEC, 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR MoboTrex, Inc. SG103A2C11BBB30-00 185.00$                                18,500.00$                         

11 300 EA SIG HEAD, 3-SEC, 12" POLY LED (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG103A1C11YYY30-00 112.00$                                33,600.00$                         

12 10 EA SIG HD, 3-SEC 12" POLY LED (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG103A1C11BBB30-00 120.00$                                1,200.00$                           

13 500 EA SIG HEAD,4-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM. MoboTrex, Inc. SG104A2C11YYY40-18 224.00$                                112,000.00$                       

14 10 EA SIG HEAD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG104A2C11BBB40-18 245.00$                                2,450.00$                           

15 100 EA SIG HEAD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG104A1C11YYY40-18 152.00$                                15,200.00$                         

16 10 EA SIG HD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG104A1C11BBB40-18 162.00$                                1,620.00$                           

17 300 EA SIG HEAD,5-SEC, CLUSTER 12" LED COMPAT. MoboTrex, Inc. SG1T5H2C11YYY50-26 425.00$                                127,500.00$                       

18 20 EA SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG1T5H2C11BBB50-26 460.00$                                9,200.00$                           

19 50 EA SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG1T5H1C11YYY50-26 375.00$                                18,750.00$                         

20 20 EA SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG1T5H1C11BBB50-26 390.00$                                7,800.00$                           

21 300 EA. SIG HEAD,1-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM. MoboTrex, Inc. SG101A2C11YYY10-00 55.00$                                  16,500.00$                         

22 30 EA. SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG101A2C11BBB10-00 58.00$                                  1,740.00$                           

23 30 EA. SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW) MoboTrex, Inc. SG101A1C11YYY10-00 40.00$                                  1,200.00$                           

24 10 EA. SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. SG101A1C11BBB10-00 42.00$                                  420.00$                              

25 300 EA. TUNNEL VISOR-12 IN. MoboTrex, Inc. A85230712 15.00$                                  4,500.00$                           

26 30 EA. TUNNEL VISOR-12IN. POLY (SPECIFY COLOR) MoboTrex, Inc. A70012004 9.00$                                    270.00$                              

27 200 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECTION 12"SIGNALS MoboTrex, Inc. BPA503ANF 62.00$                                  12,400.00$                         

28 30 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 4-SECTION 12"SIGNALS MoboTrex, Inc. BPA504ANF 92.00$                                  2,760.00$                           

29 30 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 5-SECT 12"CLUSTER SIGNALS MoboTrex, Inc. BPA503HNF02 130.00$                                3,900.00$                           

30 10 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECT 12" SIGNALS (POLY) Pelco, Inc BK-1003-F 70.00$                                  700.00$                              

31 10 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 4-SEC 12" SIGNALS (POLY) Pelco, Inc. BK-1004-F 88.00$                                  880.00$                              

32 10 EA. BACKPLATES FOR 5-SECT 12" SIGNALS (POLY) Pelco, Inc. BK-1007-F 140.00$                                1,400.00$                           

889,490.00$                          LOT 2 - SUBTOTAL

LOT #3

Items 33 – 35 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

33 4000 EA. HANGER, 1 WAY SPANWIRE W/ BOTTOM CAP MoboTrex, Inc. B2408NC-12 72.00$                                  288,000.00$                       

34 50 EA. HANGER, 1 WAY SPANWIRE W/ BOTTOM CAP (sp. color) MoboTrex, Inc. B2408NC-13 75.00$                                  3,750.00$                           

35 3000 EA BALANCE ADJUSTER, UNIVERSAL MoboTrex, Inc. A32000 30.00$                                  90,000.00$                         

381,750.00$                         LOT 3 - SUBTOTAL

LOT #4

Items 36 – 38 as individual items 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

36 50 EA. LOUVER, O DEG. STRAIGHT FOR 12" SIGNAL MoboTrex, Inc. A70186114 186.00$                                9,300.00$                           

37 50 EA. LOUVER, 7 DEG CUT-OFF FOR 12" SIGNAL MoboTrex, Inc. A85227014 186.00$                                9,300.00$                           

38 150 EA HANGER, EXT. ASSY, FOR SEPARATION, YEL Pelco, Inc. TBD 50.00$                                  7,500.00$                           

26,100.00$                            LOT 4 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #5

Items 39 – 42 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

39 100 EA. POLE, ALUM SIG PEDESTAL 4' W/CAP Pelco, Inc. PB-5100-04-PNC 120.00$                                12,000.00$                         

40 250 EA. POLE, ALUM SIG PEDESTAL 7' W/CAP Pelco, Inc. PB-5100-07-PNC 172.00$                                43,000.00$                         

41 350 EA POLE BASE, SQUARE TYPE FOR PEDESTAL Pelco, Inc. PB-5334-PNC 148.00$                                51,800.00$                         

42 20 EA POLE BASE, OCTAGONAL TYPE FOR PEDESTAL Pelco, Inc. PB-5349-PNC 180.00$                                3,600.00$                           

110,400.00$                         LOT 5 - SUBTOTAL

LOT #6

Items 43 – 49 as individual

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

43 50 EA. POLE, STEEL SIG PEDESTAL&BASE 14' W/CAP Pelco, Inc SP-1009-NC-14-GLV 1,550.00$                             77,500.00$                         

44 25 EA. POLE BASE, TRANSFORMER FOR 14' STEEL POL Pelco, Inc PB-5514-PNC 340.00$                                8,500.00$                           

45 10 EA ANCHOR BOLTS 18" FOR TYPE I PED - 4/SET MoboTrex, Inc UA246 30.00$                                  300.00$                              

46 10 EA ANCHOR BOLTS 2' FOR TYPE II PED - 4/SET NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

47 100 EA ANCHOR BOLTS 4' FOR TYPE III PED - 4/SET NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

48 1000 EA BUTTON, PEDESTRIAN PUSH- W/ HARDWARE - LG Pelco, Inc. SE-2005-08-P29 45.00$                                  45,000.00$                         

49 100 EA APS PUSH BUTTON DETECTOR STATION (NO CCU) NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

131,300.00$                          LOT 6 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #7

Items 50 – 51 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

50 5 EA APS PUSH BUTTON DETECTOR STATION FOR CCU NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

51 1 EA APS CENTRAL CONTROL UNIT NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

-$                                      LOT 7 -SUBTOTAL 

LOT #8

Items 52 – 55 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

52 250 EA. POLE SIGNAL MOUNTING ASSY FOR 1-WAY PED Pelco, Inc. SP-5523-P29 90.00$                                  22,500.00$                         

53 50 EA. POLE SIGNAL MOUNTING ASSY FOR 2-WAY PED Pelco, Inc. SP-5522-P29 205.00$                                10,250.00$                         

54 300 EA SLIP FITTER 1-WAY POST TOP ASSY Pelco, Inc. SE-3037-P29 75.00$                                  22,500.00$                         

55 100 EA SLIP FIT 2WAY POST TOP ASSEMBLY Pelco, Inc. SE3257-P29 200.00$                                20,000.00$                         

75,250.00$                            LOT 8 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #9

Items 56 – 60 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

56 10 EA. PED HEAD, 1 SECTION 16" CLAMSHELL(LEFT) MoboTrex, Inc. SG7MZ21C3YBY10-49 180.00$                                1,800.00$                           



57 10 EA. PED HEAD, 1 SECTION 16" CLAMSHEL (RIGHT) MoboTrex, Inc. SG7MZ22C3YBY10-49 180.00$                                1,800.00$                           

58 700 EA PED HEAD, 1-SEC 16" ALUM LED COMPATIBLE MoboTrex, Inc. SG7SZ20C3YBY10-00 120.00$                                84,000.00$                         

59 50 EA TUNNEL VISOR FOR 16" PED MoboTrex, Inc. A85230912 22.50$                                  1,125.00$                           

60 10 EA PED HEAD, 1SEC 16" POLY LED COMPATIBLE MoboTrex, Inc. SG7SZ10C3YBY10-00 70.00$                                  700.00$                              

89,425.00$                            LOT 9 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #10

Items 61 – 69 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

61 350 EA. SIGNAL BRACKET, 46" TUBE Pelco, Inc AB-2003-46-P29 30.00$                                  10,500.00$                         

62 100 EA. SIGNAL BRACKET, 58" TUBE Pelco, Inc AB-2003-58-PNC 38.00$                                  3,800.00$                           

63 500 EA SIGNAL BRACKET, ARM KIT FOR 3-SEC Pelco, Inc AB-4005-SS-PNC 31.00$                                  15,500.00$                         

64 100 EA SIGNAL BRACKET, 37" TUBE Pelco, Inc AB-2003-37-PNC 25.00$                                  2,500.00$                           

65 50 EA SIGNAL BRACKET, ARM KIT FOR 5-SEC Pelco, Inc AB-5005-SS-PNC 148.00$                                7,400.00$                           

66 50 EA SIGN BRACKET, 18" TUBE (FOR 24" SIGN) Pelco, Inc AB-0507-18-SS-PNC 24.00$                                  1,200.00$                           

67 50 EA SIGN BRACKET, 24" TUBE (FOR 30" SIGN) Pelco, Inc AB-0507-24-SS-PNC 27.00$                                  1,350.00$                           

68 50 EA SIGN BRACKET, 30" TUBE (FOR 36" SIGN) Pelco, Inc AB-0507-30-SS-PNC 31.00$                                  1,550.00$                           

69 800 EA SIGNAL/SIGN CLAMP KIT, CABLE MOUNT 96" Pelco, Inc AB-3055-96-SS-PNC 88.00$                                  70,400.00$                         

114,200.00$                          LOT 10 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #11

Items 70 – 73 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

70 50 EA. LED SIGN, NO L./R TURN TRAIN NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

71 5 EA. LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (DO NOT ENTER TRAIN) NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

72 10 EA LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (NO TURN ON RED) NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

73 5 EA LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (LEFT TURN YIELD) NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

-$                                      LOT 11 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #12

Items 74 – 75 as individual items 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

74 70 EA. BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F1 MoboTrex, Inc. RG-NCFLRF1 475.00$                                33,250.00$                         

75 50 EA. BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F3 MoboTrex, Inc. RG-NCFLRF3 1,250.00$                             62,500.00$                         

95,750.00$                            LOT 12 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #13

Items 76 – 77 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE

76 30 EA. BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F2 MoboTrex, Inc. RG-NCFLRF2 1,350.00$                             40,500.00$                         

77 20 EA. TIME SWITCH WITH 2 OUTPUT CIRCUITS Eltec NTC17E/861506NC 440.00$                                8,800.00$                           

49,300.00$                            LOT 13 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #14

Items 78 – 79 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

78 800 EA. BOX, PULL, CONCRETE POLYMER WITH COVER NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

79 20 EA. COVER, PULL BOX, CONCRETE POLYMER NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

-$                                      LOT 14 - SUBTOTAL 

LOT #15

Items 80 – 83 as one composite lot 

ITEM QTY UOM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER MODEL NUMBER UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

80 20 EA. BOX, OVERSIZED PULL W/COVER "NCDOT FIBER NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

81 1 EA. COVER, OVERSIZED PULL BOX "NCDOT FIBER NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

82 1 EA BOX, OVERSIZED PULL W/COVER "TRAFFIC SIGNAL" NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

83 1 EA COVER, OVERSIZED PULL BOX"TRAFFIC SIGNAL" NO BID -$                                     -$                                    

-$                                     LOT 15 - SUBTOTAL

LOT SUBTOTALS

LOT # UOM DESCRIPTION LOT SUBTOTALS

1 LOT Items 1 – 8 as one composite lot  $                      36,351.00 

2 LOT Items 9 – 32 as one composite lot  $                    889,490.00 

3 LOT Items 33 – 35 as one composite lot  $                    381,750.00 

4 LOT Items 36 – 38 as individual items  $                      26,100.00 

5 LOT Items 39 – 42 as one composite lot  $                    110,400.00 

6 LOT Items 43 – 49 as individual  $                    131,300.00 

7 LOT Items 50 – 51 as one composite lot  $                                   -   

8 LOT Items 52 – 55 as one composite lot  $                      75,250.00 

9 LOT Items 56 – 60 as one composite lot  $                      89,425.00 

10 LOT Items 61 – 69 as one composite lot  $                    114,200.00 

11 LOT Items 70 – 73 as one composite lot  $                                   -   

12 LOT Items 74 – 75 as individual items  $                      95,750.00 

13 LOT Items 76 – 77 as one composite lot  $                      49,300.00 

14 LOT Items 78 – 79 as one composite lot  $                                   -   

15 LOT Items 80 – 83 as one composite lot  $                                   -   

1,999,316.00$                                                             (Lots 1-15) TOTAL COST  




