

LOT #1							
Items 1 – 8 as one composite lot							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	200	EA.	SIG HEAD, 3 SEC, 8" LED COMPATIBLE – ALUM			No Bid	#VALUE!
2	5	EA.	SIG HD 3-SEC, 8" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
3	5	EA	SIG HEAD, 3-SEC, 8" POLY LED (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
4	5	EA	SIG HD 3-SEC, 8" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
5	10	EA	TUNNEL VISOR-8 IN. (YELLOW COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
6	1	EA	TUNNEL VISOR-8IN. POLY (YELLOW COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
7	1	EA	BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECTION 8" SIGNALS			No Bid	#VALUE!
8	1	EA	BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECT 8" SIGNALS (POLY)			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 1 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #2							
Items 9 – 32 as one composite lot							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
9	3000	EA.	SIG HEAD,3-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM.			No Bid	#VALUE!
10	100	EA.	SIG HD 3-SEC, 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
11	300	EA	SIG HEAD, 3-SEC, 12" POLY LED (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
12	10	EA	SIG HD, 3-SEC 12" POLY LED (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
13	500	EA	SIG HEAD,4-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM.			No Bid	#VALUE!
14	10	EA	SIG HEAD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
15	100	EA	SIG HEAD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
16	10	EA	SIG HD, 4-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
17	300	EA	SIG HEAD,5-SEC, CLUSTER 12" LED COMPAT.			No Bid	#VALUE!
18	20	EA	SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
19	50	EA	SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
20	20	EA	SIG HD, 5-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
21	300	EA.	SIG HEAD,1-SEC, 12" LED COMPATIBLE-ALUM.			No Bid	#VALUE!
22	30	EA.	SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED ALUM (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
23	30	EA.	SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED POLY (YELLOW)			No Bid	#VALUE!
24	10	EA.	SIG HD, 1-SEC 12" LED POLY (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
25	300	EA.	TUNNEL VISOR-12 IN.			No Bid	#VALUE!
26	30	EA.	TUNNEL VISOR-12IN. POLY (SPECIFY COLOR)			No Bid	#VALUE!
27	200	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECTION 12"SIGNALS			No Bid	#VALUE!
28	30	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 4-SECTION 12"SIGNALS			No Bid	#VALUE!
29	30	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 5-SECT 12"CLUSTER SIGNALS			No Bid	#VALUE!
30	10	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 3-SECT 12" SIGNALS (POLY)			No Bid	#VALUE!
31	10	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 4-SEC 12" SIGNALS (POLY)			No Bid	#VALUE!
32	10	EA.	BACKPLATES FOR 5-SECT 12" SIGNALS (POLY)			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 2 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #3							
Items 33 – 35 as one composite lot							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
33	4000	EA.	HANGER, 1 WAY SPANWIRE W/ BOTTOM CAP			No Bid	#VALUE!
34	50	EA.	HANGER, 1 WAY SPANWIRE W/ BOTTOM CAP (sp. color)			No Bid	#VALUE!
35	3000	EA	BALANCE ADJUSTER, UNIVERSAL			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 3 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #4							
Items 36 – 38 as individual items							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
36	50	EA.	LOUVER, 0 DEG. STRAIGHT FOR 12" SIGNAL			No Bid	#VALUE!

37	50	EA.	LOUVER, 7 DEG CUT-OFF FOR 12" SIGNAL			No Bid	#VALUE!
38	150	EA.	HANGER, EXT. ASSY, FOR SEPARATION, YEL			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 4 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #5							
<i>Items 39 – 42 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
39	100	EA.	POLE, ALUM SIG PEDESTAL 4' W/CAP			\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00
40	250	EA.	POLE, ALUM SIG PEDESTAL 7' W/CAP			\$ 135.00	\$ 33,750.00
41	350	EA.	POLE BASE, SQUARE TYPE FOR PEDESTAL			\$ 130.00	\$ 45,500.00
42	20	EA.	POLE BASE, OCTAGONAL TYPE FOR PEDESTAL			\$ 186.00	\$ 3,720.00
						\$ 92,470.00	LOT 5 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #6							
<i>Items 43 – 49 as individual</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
43	50	EA.	POLE, STEEL SIG PEDESTAL&BASE 14' W/CAP			\$ 2,250.00	\$ 112,500.00
44	25	EA.	POLE BASE, TRANSFORMER FOR 14' STEEL POL			\$ 1,500.00	\$ 37,500.00
45	10	EA.	ANCHOR BOLTS 18" FOR TYPE I PED - 4/SET			No Bid	#VALUE!
46	10	EA.	ANCHOR BOLTS 2" FOR TYPE II PED - 4/SET			No Bid	#VALUE!
47	100	EA.	ANCHOR BOLTS 4" FOR TYPE III PED - 4/SET			No Bid	#VALUE!
48	1000	EA.	BUTTON, PEDESTRIAN PUSH- W/ HARDWARE - LG			No Bid	#VALUE!
49	100	EA.	APS PUSH BUTTON DETECTOR STATION (NO CCU)			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 6 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #7							
<i>Items 50 – 51 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	5	EA.	APS PUSH BUTTON DETECTOR STATION FOR CCU			No Bid	#VALUE!
51	1	EA.	APS CENTRAL CONTROL UNIT			No Bid	#VALUE!
							LOT 7 -SUBTOTAL
LOT #8							
<i>Items 52 – 55 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
52	250	EA.	POLE SIGNAL MOUNTING ASSY FOR 1-WAY PED			\$ 86.00	\$ 21,500.00
53	50	EA.	POLE SIGNAL MOUNTING ASSY FOR 2-WAY PED			\$ 175.00	\$ 8,750.00
54	300	EA.	SLIP FITTER 1-WAY POST TOP ASSY			\$ 40.00	\$ 12,000.00
55	100	EA.	SLIP FIT 2WAY POST TOP ASSEMBLY			\$ 170.00	\$ 17,000.00
						\$ 59,250.00	LOT 8 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #9							
<i>Items 56 – 60 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
56	10	EA.	PED HEAD, 1 SECTION 16" CLAMSHELL(LEFT)			No Bid	#VALUE!
57	10	EA.	PED HEAD, 1 SECTION 16" CLAMSHEL (RIGHT)			No Bid	#VALUE!
58	700	EA.	PED HEAD, 1-SEC 16" ALUM LED COMPATIBLE			No Bid	#VALUE!
59	50	EA.	TUNNEL VISOR FOR 16" PED			No Bid	#VALUE!
60	10	EA.	PED HEAD, 1SEC 16" POLY LED COMPATIBLE			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 9 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #10							
<i>Items 61 – 69 as one composite lot</i>							

ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
61	350	EA.	SIGNAL BRACKET, 46" TUBE			No Bid	#VALUE!
62	100	EA.	SIGNAL BRACKET, 58" TUBE			No Bid	#VALUE!
63	500	EA	SIGNAL BRACKET, ARM KIT FOR 3-SEC			No Bid	#VALUE!
64	100	EA	SIGNAL BRACKET, 37" TUBE			No Bid	#VALUE!
65	50	EA	SIGNAL BRACKET, ARM KIT FOR 5-SEC			No Bid	#VALUE!
66	50	EA	SIGN BRACKET, 18" TUBE (FOR 24" SIGN)			No Bid	#VALUE!
67	50	EA	SIGN BRACKET, 24" TUBE (FOR 30" SIGN)			No Bid	#VALUE!
68	50	EA	SIGN BRACKET, 30" TUBE (FOR 36" SIGN)			No Bid	#VALUE!
69	800	EA	SIGNAL/SIGN CLAMP KIT, CABLE MOUNT 96"			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 10 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #11							
<i>Items 70 – 73 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
70	50	EA.	LED SIGN, NO L./R TURN TRAIN			No Bid	#VALUE!
71	5	EA.	LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (DO NOT ENTER TRAIN)			No Bid	#VALUE!
72	10	EA	LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (NO TURN ON RED)			No Bid	#VALUE!
73	5	EA	LED SIGN, BLANKOUT (LEFT TURN YIELD)			No Bid	#VALUE!
						\$ -	LOT 11 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #12							
<i>Items 74 – 75 as individual items</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
74	70	EA.	BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F1			No Bid	#VALUE!
75	50	EA.	BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F3			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 12 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #13							
<i>Items 76 – 77 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
76	30	EA.	BEACON CONTROLLER ASSY. TYPE F2			No Bid	#VALUE!
77	20	EA.	TIME SWITCH WITH 2 OUTPUT CIRCUITS			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 13 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #14							
<i>Items 78 – 79 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
78	800	EA.	BOX, PULL, CONCRETE POLYMER WITH COVER			No Bid	#VALUE!
79	20	EA.	COVER, PULL BOX, CONCRETE POLYMER			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 14 - SUBTOTAL
LOT #15							
<i>Items 80 – 83 as one composite lot</i>							
ITEM	QTY	UOM	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
80	20	EA.	BOX, OVERSIZED PULL W/COVER "NCDOT FIBER			No Bid	#VALUE!
81	1	EA.	COVER, OVERSIZED PULL BOX "NCDOT FIBER			No Bid	#VALUE!
82	1	EA	BOX, OVERSIZED PULL W/COVER "TRAFFIC SIGNAL"			No Bid	#VALUE!
83	1	EA	COVER, OVERSIZED PULL BOX"TRAFFIC SIGNAL"			No Bid	#VALUE!
						#VALUE!	LOT 15 - SUBTOTAL
LOT SUBTOTALS							

LOT #	UOM	DESCRIPTION	LOT SUBTOTALS			
1	LOT	Items 1 – 8 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
2	LOT	Items 9 – 32 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
3	LOT	Items 33 – 35 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
4	LOT	Items 36 – 38 as individual items	#VALUE!			
5	LOT	Items 39 – 42 as one composite lot	\$ 92,470.00			
6	LOT	Items 43 – 49 as individual	#VALUE!			
7	LOT	Items 50 – 51 as one composite lot	\$ -			
8	LOT	Items 52 – 55 as one composite lot	\$ 59,250.00			
9	LOT	Items 56 – 60 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
10	LOT	Items 61 – 69 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
11	LOT	Items 70 – 73 as one composite lot	\$ -			
12	LOT	Items 74 – 75 as individual items	#VALUE!			
13	LOT	Items 76 – 77 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
14	LOT	Items 78 – 79 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			
15	LOT	Items 80 – 83 as one composite lot	#VALUE!			