Call Order 001 (DJ00508) Erg Est = 5 2,766,202.60 RESURFACING OF 2 SECTIONS OF NC 200 & 5 SECONDARY ROADS

Bid Amount	Bidder ID	Bond ID	Vendor Name
\$2,819,276.97	15412	SNC12282241	LYNCHES RIVER CONTRACTING INC
\$2,899,252.03	3655	SNC01087810	BLYTHE CONSTRUCTION INC

Call Order 002 (DJ00503) Eng. Est= \$160,414.00 CLEARING - INTERSECTION OF NC 115 & POTTS ST

Bid Amount	Bidder ID	Bond ID	Vendor Name
\$102,500.00	20462	No Bid Bond ID	JORDAN BROTHERS CONTRACTING, LLC
\$128,905.00	5274	No Bid Bond ID	PARRISH CONTRACTING LLC
\$162,294.83	9965	No Bid Bond ID	SMITH-ROWE, LLC
\$192,223.47	1713	No Bid Bond ID	COUNTRY BOY LANDSCAPING INC
\$198,820.00	8017	No Bid Bond ID	SHAUN LACKEY EXCAVATING LLC
\$214,714.00	20351	No Bid Bond ID	AC GRADING & FARM INC
\$260,062.80	18881	No Bid Bond ID	HUSS BORING, LLC
\$371,266.25	20440	No Bid Bond ID	CINDERELLA PARTNERS INC

Janya Olmord-Admin. Officer Jul Man - Contracts Engineer

North Carolina Department of Transportation **BID OPENING RESULTS AS READ**

Bid Opening Date: January 17, 2024 @ 2:00 PM

WBS Number:

10.106031A, Etc

Description:

"As Needed" Large Debris Removal

Location:

Various Interstate and Primary Routes (I-77, I-277, I-85, I-485, US 74 from WT Harris Blvd to I-277, NC 16 Brookshire

Blvd (I-277 to I-85) and Monroe Expressway)

Contract No:

MJ00033

Engineer's Estimate: \$495,000.00

CONTRACTOR	BID AMOUNT
Dixie Lawn Service. Inc.	\$1,886,000.00

Total	Ride	Receiv	zod.	1	
I Otal	DIUS	Kecer	veu:	1	

Bids opened by:

Title:

Contracts Engineer

Witnessed by:

Title:

Admin. Officer I

Jared Mathis

July Work

Tanya Almond

Janya Olmond