North Carolina Department of Transportation

BID OPENING
RESULTS AS READ

Bid Opening Date: April 21, 2021 @ 2:00 PM

WBS Number: 10.101311, 10.108411, 10.201311 & 10.208411

Description: Miscellaneous Asphalt Resurfacing, Milling, Widening,
Shoulder Construction, Shoulder Reconstruction and
Thermoplastic Pavement Markings

Location: Various Locations in Stanly and Cabarrus Co.

Contract No: 10-01-149

Engineer’s Estimate: $ 2,061,500.00

CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT
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| Total Bids Received: | 4 \
Bids opened by: Burleson Title:  Contracts Engineer
Witnessed by: Cindy lorlano Title:  Admin. Officer I



North Carolina Department of Transportation

BID OPENING
RESULTS AS READ

Bid Opening Date: April 21, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
WBS Number: 10.101311, 10.108411, 10.201311 & 10.208411

Description: Tree Removal & Brush Cutting on an “As needed” Basis

Location: Various Locations in Stanly and Cabarrus Co.

Contract No: 10-01-148

Engineer’s Estimate: $ 175,000.00
| —

CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT
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Bids opened by:  Terry Burleson Title:  Contracts Engineer
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Letting of 04/21/2021 NCDOT-DIVISIONS Bid Summary Report

Call Order 001 (DJ00372)
GRADING, PAVING, DRAINAGE, & STRUCTURE; REPLACE BRIDGE #53 OVER COLD WATER CREEK ON SR 2114

(CENTERGROVE ROAD) IN CABARRUS COUNTY E?C‘ ﬂ ') 5 65—) L (27 ‘1 iy

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$1,761,841.25 3377 SNC21769284 DANE CONSTRUCTION INC
$1,987,615.10 3186 SNC21901477 BOGGS CONTRACTING INC
$2,211,054.50 3655 SNC21226079 BLYTHE CONSTRUCTION INC
$2,239,006.75 3747 SF3A-WILWB-G47H-2CCC ilégogscggﬁ;$:ﬁg.f_ggNAcgIVISION oF
$2,373,190.87 16044 SNC21173454 NJR GROUP INC

Call Order 002 (DJ00359)
GRADING, PAVING, MONOLITHIC CONCRETE ISLANDS AND THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKINGS AT THE
INTERSECTION OF NORTH EAST CONNECTOR (SR 1650) AND MOSS SPRINGS ROAD IN STANLY COUNTY

Eng 65+ 8§ 339,%385.00

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$195,174.45 3075 VERU-DFG9-9GP1-DUUD J T RUSSELL & SONS INC
$230,316.90 16044 No Bid Bond ID NJR GROUP INC

Call Order 003 (DJ00381)
INSTALLATION OF 24" RCP AND 24" CSP DRAINAGE PIPE ON VINTAGE HILL LANE (SR 2957) 175' NORTH OF

SCOTSWAY DRIVE IN CABARRUS COUNTY £z Esf  § 74, 770, 00

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$89, 395.00 18313 No Bid Bond ID KEMP SIGMON CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.
$94,709.80 16044 No Bid Bond ID NJR GROUP INC
. RES CAROLINAS LLC DBA CAROLINA
$107,255.061 2976 NORBLGREancID ENVIRONMENTAL CONTRACTING
$104,295.00 3075 No Bid Bond ID J T RUSSELL & SONS INC
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