

Call Order 001 (DJ00398) Eng. Est. = \$1,128,877.50
GRADING, PAVING, DRAINAGE & STRUCTURE

| Bid Amount | Bidder ID | Bond ID | Vendor Name |
|----------------|-----------|---------------------|-------------------------|
| \$1,191,165.37 | 16044 | SNC07051611 | NJR GROUP INC |
| \$1,234,793.00 | 11500 | ED02-24D1-83E6-F9BC | EASTERN STRUCTURES LLC |
| \$1,273,009.99 | 9965 | E2FF-E38A-C433-BE73 | SMITH-ROWE, LLC |
| \$1,313,091.40 | 3481 | SNC06172998 | R E BURNS & SONS CO INC |

Call Order 002 (DJ00396) Eng. Est. = \$963,441.00
GRADING, PAVING, DRAINAGE & STRUCTURE; REPLACE BR #75

| Bid Amount | Bidder ID | Bond ID | Vendor Name |
|----------------|-----------|---------------------|-------------------------|
| \$1,026,028.02 | 9965 | A381-FEC4-2288-CAD9 | SMITH-ROWE, LLC |
| \$1,116,053.70 | 3481 | SNC06175790 | R E BURNS & SONS CO INC |
| \$1,564,085.57 | 3707 | F159-078D-F866-3EB4 | DELLINGER INC |

Call Order 003 (DJ00422) Eng. Est. = \$82,575.00
INSTALLATION OF SIGNAL LOOPS-VARIOUS LOCATIONS

| Bid Amount | Bidder ID | Bond ID | Vendor Name |
|-------------|-----------|----------------|--------------------------------------|
| \$70,929.50 | 3591 | No Bid Bond ID | FULCHER ELECTRIC OF FAYETTEVILLE INC |
| \$71,040.00 | 12044 | No Bid Bond ID | LMJ PAVEMENT MARKING LLC |

Call Order 004 (DJ00423) Eng. Est. = \$98,910.00
INSTALLATION OF THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKINGS

| Bid Amount | Bidder ID | Bond ID | Vendor Name |
|-------------|-----------|----------------|----------------------------|
| \$75,360.00 | 10583 | No Bid Bond ID | TMI SERVICES INC |
| \$95,770.00 | 17112 | No Bid Bond ID | TRP CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC |

Terry Beulson
Proposal Engineer

Janya Almond
Admin. Officer I