

Call Order 001 (DD00358)

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - \$3,651,486.20

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: JANUARY 11, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00358 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 47990.3.2, 47991.3.2, 47994.3.1 FEDERAL AID NO.: 0087045, 0087046, 0087047 COUNTY: EDGEcombe AND NASH COUNTIES TIP NO.: I-6041A, I-6042A, I-6045A MILES: 0.646 MILES ROUTE NO.: US 64 LOCATION: 12 BRIDGES IN EDGEcombe COUNTY & 2 BRIDGES IN NASH COUNTY TYPE OF WORK: BRIDGE PRESERVATION

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$3,340,573.11	3540	SNC22630307	LANFORD BROTHERS CO., INC.
\$4,597,214.80	7877	10F2-8C0F-8F78-3925	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICES INC
\$4,871,334.28	3752	0018-E4D8-EEA2-5DFF	TRIANGLE GRADING & PAVING INC
\$5,861,546.70	9103	XDPM-LSLW-KKB6-K836	TITAN INDUSTRIAL SERVICES INC
\$6,324,330.05	11909	SNC22993474	SOUTHERN ROAD & BRIDGE LLC

Call Order 002 (DD00368)

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - \$803,250.00

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: JANUARY 11, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00368 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 44914.3.22 FEDERAL AID NO.: 0430(010) COUNTY: EDGEcombe AND HALIFAX COUNTIES TIP NO.: R-5784EB ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN ROANOKE RAPIDS, SCOTLAND NECK, HOBGOOD AND TARBORO TYPE OF WORK: MISC. CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$611,250.00	3125	GB2A-BYPD-7SGM-U2QQ	ANDERSON & COMPANY INC
\$633,250.00	3304	SNC22440889	FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC
\$723,180.00	3083	S29N-XCQA-29U5-818R	CAROLINA EARTH MOVERS INC
\$767,000.00	16027	No Bid Bond ID	CAROLINA GROUP PROPERTIES LLC DBA CAROLINA GROUP CONTRACTING
\$977,500.00	2653	BFMR-9MAN-EXVB-E33K	BROWE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Call Order 003 (DD00369)

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - \$30,000.00

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: JANUARY 11, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00369 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 44914.3.23 FEDERAL AID NO.: 0405060 COUNTY: NASH AND WILSON COUNTIES TIP NO.: R-5784EC ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN CASTALIA AND BLACK CREEK TYPE OF WORK: MISC. CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$29,667.00	3304	No Bid Bond ID	FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC
\$39,190.00	11766	No Bid Bond ID	EASTERN EARTHSCAPES & CONSTRUCTION LLC
\$42,100.00	3083	No Bid Bond ID	CAROLINA EARTH MOVERS INC
\$42,980.00	11294	No Bid Bond ID	HOLLINS CONSTRUCTION SERVICES INC
\$98,400.00	2653	No Bid Bond ID	BROWE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY