

**Call Order 001 (DD00236)**

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: December 5, 2017 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00236 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 2018CPT.04.11.10422, 2018CPT.04.11.20422 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: Halifax County TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 32.49 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK: CRACK SEALING

Bid Amount	Bidder ID	Bond ID	Vendor Name
\$94,870.80	2903	No Bid Bond ID	SLURRY PAVERS INC
\$99,939.24	5907	No Bid Bond ID	ANNSEAL OF PA INC
\$120,213.00	10932	No Bid Bond ID	SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
\$211,185.00	2434	No Bid Bond ID	DELTA CONTRACTING INC

**Call Order 002 (DD00237)**

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: December 5, 2017 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00237 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 2018CPT.04.12.20642, 2018CPT.04.12.20982 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: Nash and Wilson Counties TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 56.95 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK: CRACK SEALING

Bid Amount	Bidder ID	Bond ID	Vendor Name
\$174,030.03	5907	No Bid Bond ID	ANNSEAL OF PA INC
\$191,341.92	2903	No Bid Bond ID	SLURRY PAVERS INC
\$210,703.90	10932	No Bid Bond ID	SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
\$335,987.30	2434	No Bid Bond ID	DELTA CONTRACTING INC

**Call Order 003 (DD00238)**

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: December 5, 2017 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00238 WBS ELEMENT NO.: 2018CPT.04.13.20512, 2018CPT.04.13.20962 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: Johnston and Wayne Counties TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 117.94 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK: CRACK SEALING

Bid Amount	Bidder ID	Bond ID	Vendor Name
\$346,743.60	2903	No Bid Bond ID	SLURRY PAVERS INC
\$601,494.00	10932	No Bid Bond ID	SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
\$766,610.00	2434	No Bid Bond ID	DELTA CONTRACTING INC

- DD00236 -  
 Fulford & Jones - \$ 120,213.00  
 Absolute Pavement Soes - \$ 94,221.00  
 Asphalt Maint. Sol. LLC - \$ 99,419.40
- DD00237 -  
 Absolute Pavement Soes. - \$ 168,563.12  
 Fulford & Jones - \$ 161,729.48
- DD00238 -  
 Absolute Pavement Soes - \$ 405,713.60  
 Fulford & Jones - \$ 459,966.00