Letting of 12/13/2017

Call Order 001 (DE00208) Engineers Estimate=$1,408,537.90
17BP.5.R.62, REPLACE BRIDGE #12 IN VANCE COUNTY

NCDOT-DIVISIONS Bid Summary Report

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$1,504,565.50 9965 SER1-CH75-PH94-T5JC SMITH-ROWE, LLC
$1,552,551.00 5072 SNC17274501 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY

$1,606,783.71 3377
$1,619,626.42 3760

VXVE-5VP2-DYQG-11M8
4JRU-QHRJ-88WQ-WSB2

Call Order 002 (DE00230) Engineers Estimate=$64,676.25
W-5601EH SIGNAL INSTALLATION IN DURHAM COUNTY

Bid Amount Bidder ID

Bond ID

DANE CONSTRUCTION INC
S T WOOTEN CORPORATION

Vendor Name

$70,660.50 3591

$74,407.50 10916

$79,764.32 7616
$88,750.00 3554

Call Order 003 (DE00206)

No Bid Bond ID

No Bid Bond ID
No Bid Bond ID
No Bid Bond ID

Engineers Estimate=$898,527.75

17BP.5.R.54, REPLACE BRIDGE #117 IN DURHAM COUNTY

FULCHER ELECTRIC OF FAYETTEVILLE
INC

CAROLINA POWER & SIGNALIZATION INC
ALS OF NORTH CAROLINA LLC
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES INC

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$919,328.69 3377 PA73-TEK2-5SB8-LTXM DANE CONSTRUCTION INC
$947,700.00 5072 SNC17936894 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY

$1,040,121.06 3760
$1,110,436.40 9965

3H87-YBP9-2PS5-H341
1TNK-84D1-5M5R-XQAB

Call Order 004 (DE00225) Engineers Estimate=$3,852,114.45
2018CPT.05.12.10731.1, 2018CPT.05.12.20731.1 RESURFACING NC 49 AND VARIOUS SECONDARY ROUTES IN PERSON

S T WOOTEN CORPORATION
SMITH-ROWE, LLC

COUNTY.

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$3,682,561.93 3419 SNC17272990 RILEY PAVING INC
$3,854,474.08 11163 UFKT-79CE-EWC2-D1L8 CAROLINA SUNROCK LLC
$5,633,016.11 3629 SNC17118976 ADAMS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Call Order 005 (DE00239)Engineers Estimate=$536,975.00
2018CPT.05.21.10922.1, PAVEMENT MARKING IMPROVEMENTS ON I-540 IN WAKE COUNTY

Bid Amount Bidder ID

Bond ID

Vendor Name

$470,290.00 3485

SNC17863780

OGLESBY CONSTRUCTION INC

NCDOT-DIVISIONS
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