Moore, Byron G

From: Griffin, Randy W

Sent: Wednesday, December 22, 2010 10:43 AM

To: Harris, Philip S

Cc: Annis, Kim H; Roebuck, Cindy; Moore, Byron G; Lancaster, Jamie J
Subject: RE: B-4261 WM 33603.4.2

Phil,

This project was investigated for on-site stream mitigation a couple years ago. There was a potential stream restoration
site, but in the end the property owner was not interested in the offer for the conservation easement. It appears that
$25K was established in the WM break by Leilani' s group for R/W to start early negotiations with the property owner on
the conservation easement. In the end, it appears that the EEP payment came from the WM break.

That being said my group has no other need for the WBS to remain open from our perspective. Let me know if you need
additional information on this project.

From: Harris, Philip S

Sent: Wednesday, December 22, 2010 7:00 AM

To: Griffin, Randy W; Moore, Byron G; Lancaster, Jamie J
Cc: Annis, Kim H; Roebuck, Cindy

Subject: FW: B-4261 WM 33603.4.2

You guys know anything about this project?

E-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law (GS 132) and
may be disclosed to third parties by an authorized state official

From: Marriott, Tonya D

Sent: Tuesday, December 21, 2010 4:24 PM

To: Roebuck, Cindy; Harris, Philip S

Subject: B-4261 WM 33603.4.2

Hello,

Can either of you please provide me with a status update on this inactive project. It has been inactive for over 3 years.

Thanks

Email correspondence to and from this sender is subject to the N.C. Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third
parties.



B-4261

Subject:
Date:

From:
Organization:
To:

CC:

Byron,

B-4261 -

Thu, 06 Mar 2008 15:14:12 -0500

"Zachery B. McNeill" <zbmcneill@dot.state.nc.us>
North Carolina Department of Transportation
Byron Moore <bgmoore@dot.state.nc.us>
LeiLani Paugh <Ilpaugh@dot.state.nc.us> ,
Randy Griffin <rgriffin@dot.state.nc.us>

The property owner (Scott Hughes) was not satisfied with the land
compg. from R/W for the proposed mitigation site on the Fork of
Cathey's Creek so I purpose that we abandon the site.

Zach
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3/7/2008 7:41 AM



B-4261WM - ROW - BRIDGE 39 & 37

OVER FORK OF CATHY'S CREEK ON SR 1520 (BRIDGE 39)
OVER CATHY'S CREEK ON SR 1520 (BRIDGE 37)
REPLACE BRIDGES

WETLAND MITIGATION

11/6/07 - REQUEST $25,000 APPR/ACQ COSTS FOR SP 701WM (PROPERTY OF SCOTT &
SANDRA HUGHES); C ROEBUCK - ar

11/13/07 - DOCUMENTATION SENT TO M DAWSON, FHWA - ar

10/26/10 - REQUEST FUNDS $33,915 FOR EEP, PTP

(f P S % P



